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Datacenter networks provide the communication substrate for large parallel computer systems that form the
ecosystem for high performance computing (HPC) systems and modern Internet applications. The design of
new datacenter networks is motivated by an array of applications ranging from communication intensive
climatology, complex material simulations and molecular dynamics to such Internet applications as Web
search, language translation, collaborative Internet applications, streaming video and voice-over-IP. For both
Supercomputing and Cloud Computing the network enables distributed applications to communicate and
interoperate in an orchestrated and efficient way. This book describes the design and engineering tradeoffs of
datacenter networks. It describes interconnection networks from topology and network architecture to
routing algorithms, and presents opportunities for taking advantage of the emerging technology trends that
are influencing router microarchitecture. With the emergence of "many-core" processor chips, it is evident
that we will also need "many-port" routing chips to provide a bandwidth-rich network to avoid the
performance limiting effects of Amdahl's Law. We provide an overview of conventional topologies and their
routing algorithms and show how technology, signaling rates and cost-effective optics are motivating new
network topologies that scale up to millions of hosts. The book also provides detailed case studies of two
high performance parallel computer systems and their networks. Table of Contents: Introduction /
Background / Topology Basics / High-Radix Topologies / Routing / Scalable Switch Microarchitecture /
System Packaging / Case Studies / Closing Remarks
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From reader reviews:

Ramon Hudson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled High Performance Datacenter Networks: Architectures, Algorithms, &
Opportunities (Synthesis Lectures on Computer Architecture). Try to stumble through book High
Performance Datacenter Networks: Architectures, Algorithms, & Opportunities (Synthesis Lectures on
Computer Architecture) as your pal. It means that it can being your friend when you truly feel alone and
beside associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The
book makes you much more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make
new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Sandra Wright:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of various
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, reading a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this High
Performance Datacenter Networks: Architectures, Algorithms, & Opportunities (Synthesis Lectures on
Computer Architecture), you could tells your family, friends and soon about yours guide. Your knowledge
can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Sandra Brown:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all
day every day to reading a e-book. The book High Performance Datacenter Networks: Architectures,
Algorithms, & Opportunities (Synthesis Lectures on Computer Architecture) it is quite good to read. There
are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. In the event you
did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read
this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

Lillian Thornton:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this High Performance Datacenter Networks:
Architectures, Algorithms, & Opportunities (Synthesis Lectures on Computer Architecture) e-book written



by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else
read the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and producing skill only for
eliminate your own hunger then you still question High Performance Datacenter Networks: Architectures,
Algorithms, & Opportunities (Synthesis Lectures on Computer Architecture) as good book not just by the
cover but also with the content. This is one guide that can break don't ascertain book by its cover, so do you
still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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