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From the New York Times bestselling author of The Importance of Being Alice comes the second
Matchmaker in Wonderland romance, where finding love means falling head over heels…
 
Lorina Liddel is terrified of embarrassing herself on national TV as the face of Dig Britain!, a new
archeological reality show. Lorina would much rather keep her head down and her hands in the dirt
underneath Ainslie Castle, but her on-screen partner is proving to be a major distraction.
 
Brother to the castle’s current lord, privileged, perfectly sculpted Gunner Ainslie is a sure bet to keep
viewers glued to their screens. Lorina intends to keep the ladies’ man focused on the job at hand, but Gunner
is confident he’ll soon have the beauty falling into his bed.
 
When an unexpected find turns the academic dig into an all-out treasure hunt, Lorina and Gunner get swept
up in the excitement. But when their steamy tryst is caught on camera, it’ll take more than an award-winning
performance to get them out of the hole they’re in…
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From reader reviews:

Bruce Zimmerman:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your knowledge
by the publication entitled A Midsummer Night's Romp: A Matchmaker in Wonderland Romance. Try to the
actual book A Midsummer Night's Romp: A Matchmaker in Wonderland Romance as your close friend. It
means that it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter
than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you
can know almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this
book.

John Frank:

With other case, little folks like to read book A Midsummer Night's Romp: A Matchmaker in Wonderland
Romance. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important a new book A Midsummer Night's Romp: A Matchmaker in Wonderland Romance. You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from book you
can recognize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple point
until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or perhaps searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's
examine.

Jamie Sparks:

The book A Midsummer Night's Romp: A Matchmaker in Wonderland Romance will bring that you the new
experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try
to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book A Midsummer Night's Romp: A
Matchmaker in Wonderland Romance is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book
from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Dedra Clark:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got students? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know that
little person including reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book. Numerous
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra A Midsummer Night's Romp: A
Matchmaker in Wonderland Romance.
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