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Cinders and ash.

That is the future that awaits the world if Evelyn cannot control the limitless power residing in the heart of
the Guardian Stone. But she is running out of time. A dozen conspiring hands are trying to claim the Orb of
Azure for themselves, and worse still, she must now contest with a god.

Half a world away, Captain Bently's quest to awaken the Guardian has failed. The cost of the journey has
been high. Prince Desperous has been killed, and the mysterious wizard Ivatelo has proven more dangerous
than anyone supposed possible. But a more dire truth haunts Bently's mind -- the Guardian is not the savior
they seek.

THE GUARDIAN STONE tells of the struggle to save the world of the living from the dominion of the
undead. But with all eyes focused on Luthuania and the final battle with the necromancer, none have noticed
that an even greater menace is lurking in the Shadows, the most treacherous of all.

With the specter of defeat looming high, there is only one certainty -- the world is going to burn. Will the
Guardian Stone be Laveria's salvation or the spark?

About The Gods and Kings Chronicles

Welcome to Laveria, a world of knights and kings, dragon fire and magic. Here lies a land haunted by the
absence of its gods and goddesses. A timeless land where chivalry reigns, and elves and dwarves still walk
the forests and the hills. A land where witches and wizards meddle in the arcane arts, and the unyielding
undead hordes of the necromancer roam the earth. Lovers of High Fantasy will not be able to look away as
they lose themselves in this legendary saga of gods and kings, mortals and monsters.

Other Books in the Series

The GuardianThe Order - Coming Soon
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From reader reviews:

Bertha Chang:

The book The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2) can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing
like a book The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2)? Wide variety you
have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will book can give many data for us. It is
absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that,
it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book The Guardian Stone: Book II of
the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2) has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Lyla Jackson:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2)
book is readable by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable reading through experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to
you. The writer involving The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2)
content conveys thinking easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in
the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you even now thinking The Guardian Stone: Book II of
the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Joyce Pippin:

The experience that you get from The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume
2) is the more deep you excavating the information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic
about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but The Guardian Stone: Book II of the
Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their
point in specific way that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this guide
is well-known enough. This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having
that The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings Chronicles (Volume 2) instantly.

Melody Herrera:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an effort
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in
the outside search likes. Maybe you answer could be The Guardian Stone: Book II of the Gods and Kings



Chronicles (Volume 2) why because the excellent cover that make you consider with regards to the content
will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading
sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.
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