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In this classic book, Michael Taussig explores the social significance of the devil in the folklore of
contemporary plantation workers and miners in South America. Grounding his analysis in Marxist theory,
Taussig finds that the fetishization of evil, in the image of the devil, mediates the conflict between
precapitalist and capitalist modes of objectifying the human condition. He links traditional narratives of the
devil-pact, in which the soul is bartered for illusory or transitory power, with the way in which production in
capitalist economies causes workers to become alienated from the commodities they produce. A new chapter
for this anniversary edition features a discussion of Walter Benjamin and Georges Bataille that extends
Taussig's ideas about the devil-pact metaphor.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Shelby:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this The Devil and Commodity Fetishism in
South America reserve written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that may be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every
ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still question The Devil and
Commodity Fetishism in South America as good book not only by the cover but also with the content. This
is one reserve that can break don't judge book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to
pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to an additional sixth sense.

India Mead:

This The Devil and Commodity Fetishism in South America is great book for you because the content and
that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and get to make decision every minute.
This particular book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling
sentences in it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you
straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Devil
and Commodity Fetishism in South America in your hand like finding the world in your arm, details in it is
not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but
this book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that?

Deanne Mohammed:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you personally is The Devil and Commodity Fetishism in South America this book consist
a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made
some analysis when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.

Cathie Moss:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Devil and Commodity
Fetishism in South America which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.
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