
Leadership Meta-Competencies: Discovering
Hidden Virtues

Dimitris Bourantas, Vasia Agapitou

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1472420683
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1472420683
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1472420683


Leadership Meta-Competencies: Discovering Hidden Virtues

Dimitris Bourantas, Vasia Agapitou

Leadership Meta-Competencies: Discovering Hidden Virtues Dimitris Bourantas, Vasia Agapitou
This book doesn't offer overrated success stories which in most cases cannot be imitated. It contains no
check lists or recipes for success and it presents no theoretically-based models. The meta-competencies
discussed in this refreshing book are timeless virtues of which effective leaders seem to possess, but which
are rarely if ever included in lists of competencies in the vast business leadership literature. They include:
Existential intelligence - distinct from the much discussed emotional intelligence, is about the ability to pose
questions and reflect on fundamental issues in ways that develop a mature ability to interpret the world and
better understand other people. Phronesis - is the ability to exercise sound judgement based on skilful
application of moral and political rationality. Solitude - is a voluntary state achieved when an individual has
the ability to momentarily withdraw and be free of external pressures and demands in order to concentrate on
desired mental-cognitive activities. Trust building - is more often discussed in leadership literature. As a
leadership competence it is about the ability to be credible, show trust in and respect for other people and
inspire trust. For the curious business practitioner, business student, or business educator wishing to consider
aspects of leadership competence that have to some extent been hidden or forgotten, this book introduces the
notion of meta-competences and deals in detail with them.
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From reader reviews:

Joann Hamilton:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated that for a while
is reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of Leadership
Meta-Competencies: Discovering Hidden Virtues book as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because
this book is greater than just a book.

William McDowell:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they
write about the knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how
to teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always
try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of
them is this Leadership Meta-Competencies: Discovering Hidden Virtues.

Norma Ochoa:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you go through a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with
soon. The Leadership Meta-Competencies: Discovering Hidden Virtues provide you with a new experience
in studying a book.

Andrew Purdie:

You may get this Leadership Meta-Competencies: Discovering Hidden Virtues by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for your knowledge.
Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by means of written or printed but can you enjoy this book by e-
book. In the modern era like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem.
Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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